
Company Name Total Amount for Justice Center Total Amount for McCurry Park

Alternative Environments $45,540.00 $127,785.60

ASAP  Management Group $46,440.00 No Bid

Baruch Constrection Group No Bid $291,999.85

Golden Landscaping LLC $242,200.00 $186,000.00

Greenlife Services $31,451.00 No Bid

Lawn Authority Lawn Care $38,100.00 $174,530.00

Mariani Enterprises, LLC DBA Castro Landscape $157,860.00 $163,680.00

Rubber Boots Lawn  Care Service $38,999.48 $89,999.99

Superior Cut Lawn Service $53,370.00 $55,800.00

Yellowstone Landscape No Bid $94,080.00

ITB 26101-B: Grass Cutting Services - Justice Center & McCurry Park
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